Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

On Feb 28, 2014, at 3:51 PM, "Young, Janet E" _ wrote:

Rich,
Following is what we initiated on 2/25/14

Debit A/ GG H\perion Air, Inc.
Amount - 5100,067.96

Wire instructions
Deutsche Bank

AJC Name: Hyperion Air, Inc.

Best Regards,

Janet Young
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