From: Dana Huggins |

on behalf of  TheBranch Staff [thebranch.staff@db.com)|

Sent: 7/30/2014 3:19:46 PM

To: TheBranch Staff [thebranch.staff@db.com]

CC: Amanda Kirby _]: Michele Garcia [_; TheBranch Staff
[thebranch.staff@db.com]

Subject: Re: Euro Request (1]

Attachments: picO0108 gif; pic0B493 gif; pic09114. gif; pic23220 gif

Classification: For internal use only
Hi amanda,

The currency has arrived.

From: TheBranch staff/db/dbcom

To: I
Date: 07/30,/2014 01:45 PM

subject: Re: Euro Request [I]

Classification: For internal use only

The order has been placed. Once the currency arrives we will notify you with
an email. Thank wvou.

To: TheBranch staff/db/dbcom@DEAMERICAS,
Date: 07/30/2014 01:33 PM
Subject: Re: Euro Request [I]

Classification: For internal use only
Thank you. Please go ahead. They will bring a check made out to AFEX for $7500

Best,
Amanda Kirby

(Embedded image moved to file: picO0l08.gif)
Amanda Kirby
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