o Amands oy (R

Sent: 5/19/2015 12:14:48 PM
To: bellaklein |
CC: Darren Indyke
Subject: FW': Euro Request [I]

¥l = Euros are ready to be picked up

From: Michele Garcia On Behalf Of TheBranch Staff
Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2015 12:13 PM

To: Amanda Kirby

Cc: TheBranch Staff

Subject: RE: Euro Request [I]

Hi

The currency has arrived and is available for pickup. Thanks.
From: Amanda Kirby

Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2015 11:02 AM

To: TheBranch Staff

Subject: RE: Euro Request [I]

Classification: For intemal use only
Hi,

Yes please. Please place the order and the client will bring in a check made out to AFEX in the amount of 57458.08

From: Michele Garcia On Behalf Of TheBranch Staff
Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2015 11:02 AM

To: Amanda Kirby

Cc: TheBranch Staff

Subject: RE: Euro Request [I]
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