From: Dana Huggins -
on behalf of  TheBranch Staff | |
Sent: 5/9/2014 1:05:42 PM

To: Margaux Megrath

CC: Paul Marris | : TheBranch Staff [_'r Vahe Stepanian

Subject: Re: Authorization to Cash Check - Darren Indyke [I]
Attachments: picl0649 gif: pic13023. gif

Classification: For internal use only

Thank you! If any issues do arise we will be in touch.

From: Margaux Mcgrath/db/dbecom

To: TheBranch Staff/db/dbcomBDBAMERTICAS,

cc: vahe Stepanian/db/dbcom@BDBAmericas, Paul Morris/db/dbcomBDBAMERICAS
Date: 05/09/2014 12:46 PM

Subject: authorization to cash check - Darren Indyke [I]

Classification: For internal use only

Haella,

Please note that Darren Indyke will be coming to the branch today with an
original signed authorization to Cash Check form, and a check to cash out 1in
the amount of 7,500 for account ending 6976. Please let me know if yvou hawve
any questions. Thank wou!

Kind regards,
Margaux McGrath
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Margaux MoGrath
Analyst

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas

Deutsche Asset & wealth Management
345 pPark Avenue, 10154-0004 New York, NY, USA
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Email
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