Subject: Re: Hyperion Air [I
From: Vahe Stepanian < =
Date: Mon, 03 Mar 2014 07:50:00 -0500

To: Amanda Kirby <N

Classification: For internal use only

Hi - hope the wknd was great. Apparently the wire was sent on 2/25.
Lets chat when you're in.

Thank vyou,
Vahe

From: Amanda Kirby/db/dbcom

Date: 02/28/2014 07:07 BM

Subiject: FEe: Hyperion Air [I]

Classification: For internal use only

Thanks Vahe. Was it sent today? Will call monday

————— Original Message ————-

From: Vahe Stepanian

Sent: 02/28/2014 05:16 FM EST

To: Amanda Kirby

Subject: Hyperion Air [I]
Classification: For internal use only

Hi Amanda -

Give me a call Monday EM. JPM called and mentioned that they sent a wire to
the above listed checking acct. (ending x432) and Rich claims it is not yet in
that account.

Janet (B JPM) said that shes sent wires there before and is surprised it
hasn't yet been posted.

Her contact info:

If she’s cut con Monday b/c of storm, you can speak to Gina about it.

EFTA01351075



Regardless, lets chat before you do.
Hope Mashville is awesome :)

Thank vyou,
Vahe
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