Subject: Fwd: DE cash

From: Bella Hlein <[

Date: Fri, 05 Jan 2018 12:20:51 -0500

To: Cynthia Rodrigue: <HEEEG—

Cynthia,We made multiple attempts to withdraw any amount in the range of 51001 and $29%7.
rk. Please advise.

Thank wou,

Bella

Begin forwarded message:
From: Bella Klein <M
Subject: DB cash

Date: January 5, 2018 at 12:14:50 PM EST

Ta: Richard Kahn < -

Cynthia cenfirmed that we can withdraw 3k cash, the proeblem might be that the ATM machine autematica
1ly is charging %3 transaction fee, that DB void when posted to the account, but total for withdrawa

1 becomes 53003 and transaction is declined. Hext time please try to withdraw cash under
hould work.

Thank wou,
Bella
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