Subject: FW: JEE wire to Kellerhals [C]
From: Melinda Roy

Date: Mon, 11 Jan 2016 08:22:07 -0500
To: Paul Morris

Cc: 3j Litchford <

Classification: Confidential

FYI — we had a $20M outflow Friday afternoon

From: bellaklein [mailto:| GGG

Sent: Friday, January 08, 2016 3:35 PM

To: Melinda Roy

Cc: Jj Litchford; Darren Indyke; Richard Kahn
Subject: JEE wire to Kellerhals

Melinda,

We sent a request to Vahe to transfer funds from Haze Trust to JEE.

money received please process the attached wire

Thank you,
Bella

]
Tel: ]

When

EFTA01352985



