From: bellaklein [ i —

Sent: 2/24/2014 4:19:40 PM
To. Amanda Kirby |
Subject: Re: JEE WT to Sarl Glustin

sorry, just emailed corrected wire

On Feb 24, 2014, at 4:05 PM, Amanda Kirby _ wrote:

Classification: Public

Bella -- | just realized that this wire states "two thousand Euros (5,000 euros)”. Could you resend it with the correct
amount? Either 2,000 or 5,000 Euros

Kind regards,
Amanda Kirby

<Mail Attachment gif>

Amanda Kirby

Assotiale

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Amaericas
Deutsche Asset & Wealth Management

345 Park Avenue, 10154-0004 New York, NY, LISA
Tal. +

Fax +

Email

<Mail Attachment. gif>

Secunties offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.
—- Forwarded by Amanda Kirby/dbidbeom on 022452014 04:04 PM —-

From bellakizin m

Amanda Kirby/db/d R

Richard Kahn <[~ = Saler <N
02/24/2014 0333 PM

JEE WT ta Sarl Glustin

Please confirm,

Thank you,

Bella

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: Message from

Date: February 24, 2014 3:09:37 PM EST
To:
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