From: Amanda Kirby

Sent: 3/27/2015 12:48:21 PM

To: hellaklein-

CC: Darren Indyke Richard Kahn _
Subject: RE: JEE WT - confirmed

Thanks Bella. I'll send the Reg E Disclosure once | have it

From: bellaklei

Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 12:46 PM
To: Amanda Kirby

Cc: Darren Indyke; Richard Kahn
Subject: JEE WT - confirmed

Amanda,
Attached is the same wire 10 Russia with changed intermediarny bank account, It is already confirmed with Darren.  Please provide
bank reference when available.

Thank vou
Bella
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