
From: Kathryn Kathryn 3 Stanfield 
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2015 3:18 PM 
To: Jj Litchford 
Subject: RE: lEE wire [I] 

Classification For internal use only 

Jj 

You would need to do an error and claim 

Kathryn J Stanfield 
DB Services NewJersey Inc 
Deutsche Asset. & Wealth Management 

Peon-len-4v- Perft-mt 

I 

From: Jj Litchford 
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2015 3:16 PM 
To: Kathryn 3 Stanfield 
Subject: RE: JEE wire [I] 

Classification: For Internal use only 

Got it, is there any way to request that back or to credit the $35? The client wasn't happy about it and we always waive 
their fee on wires. 

If not, no worries just figured I'd ask. 

Thanks, 
JJ 
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