
New York, NY 10022 

On Sep 18, 2015, at 4:53 PM, Jj Litchford < M> wrote: 

The payment date below is 9/21 so I will keep my eyes peeled Monday. 

Hope you have a nice weekend. 

<image001 gif> 

JJ Litchtord 
Associate Banker 

Deutsche Banic Trust Company Americas 
litinagement 
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From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, September 18, 2015 4:35 PM
To: Jj Litchford 
Subject: Fwd: Payment to JEE 

please look out for incoming wire of 15,000 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Mark Lloyd <eDI.corn> 
Subject: Payment to JEE 
Date: September 18, 2015 at 4:32:31 PM EDT 
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