
what is the update as i need to make decision by 12pm on whether or not to cancel order 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel
fa 
ce 

On May 4, 2015, at 10:56 AM, Ron Sharif < > wrote: 

Richard, 
We have no funds yet. We checked with our bank. One of my sales manager will call you to answer all 
thank you for your patience. 
-Ron 

-----Original Message 

From: "Richard Kahn" [mailto:"Richard Kahn" 

Sent: 5/4/2015 9:04:00 AM 

To: "Ron Shari?' 

Subject: Re: purchase order for 2015 gmc yukon 

can you please call me 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel

l

fa 
ce 

On May 2, 2015, at 2:25 PM, Ron Sharif > wrote: 

One Simple Price 
E:'PER6ENCE THE DIFFER E E; 

2 
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