Yes , thank you

On Jul 30, 2015, 3:43:57 PM, bellakiein wrote:Will wire today $5000 to your personal account that
inu will need to return back after interview. Please confirm it i accll

Thank you,
Bella

ok, thank you.
Thank you,
Bella

On Jul 30, 2015, 2:43:23 PM, bellaklein wrote:and hotel too?

Thank you,
Bella

| have tickets

L OnJul 30, 2015, 2:42:19 PM, bellaklein wrote:you don't have tickets, correct?
Thank you,
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