o 6ela ko (R

Sent: 9/5/2018 12:04:57 PM
cC: ; Darren Indyke [_]: Richard Kahn [_
Subject: Re: JEE wire to Climatis

Attachments: DB_WT Climatis_090518 2Zndsemester payment.pdf; Untitled attachment 27234 txt

Please provide wire transfer confirmation when available.

Thank wyou,
gella

= On Sep 5, 2018, at 11:47 aM, Bella Klein _ wrote:
-

» Marjorie,

» Please process the attached wire

-
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