From: Bella Klei

Sent: 6/21/2017 3:20:50 PM

To: Cynthia Rodriguez |

cc: w Darren Indyke _,- Stewart Oldfield
Subject: Re: Euros

Cynthia,

Please proceed with the order

Thank you,

Bella

On Jun 21, 2017, at 12:43 PM, Cynthia Rodriguez _ wrote:

Hi Rich,
Afex provided the following:
£7497.60 USD @ 1.136 = 6600 EUR.

Please confirm in order to proceed. Thank you.

Kind regards,

Cynthia Rodriguez

Cynthia Rodriguez

Azsistant Vice President

Deutscha Bank Trust Company Americas -
Deutsche Bank Wealth Management
345 Park Avenue, 24th Fl 10154-0004 Mew York, NY, USA

From: Richard Kahn GGG
Sent: Wednesday, June 21, 2017 11:32 AM

To: Cynthia Rodriguez

Cc: Bella Klein; Darren Indyke; Stewart Oldfield

Subject: Re: Euros

that rate is not fair - please see if you can improve pricing as
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