fom: Viay-Asavant [

Sent: 12/3/2018 12:13:48 AM
To: Stewart Oldfield
CC: Richard larossi : Bri illin [ : Vinita Advani

Subject: RE: Gratitude

Importance:  High
Thank you for the update, Stewart!!
We look forward to next update, post your call today.

Kind Regards,

Vijay Sawant

KYC Case Representative

Deutsche CIB Centre Private Limited - Deutsche Bank Group
Wealth Management

From: Stewart Oldfield
Sent: Friday, November 30, 2018 7:58 PM
To: Vijay-A Sawant <

=; Vinita Advani

Subject: RE: Gratitude

Have spoken to both clients (Gratitude and the family office of the donor). I'm not positive that they are both on the
same page still. Have a follow up call Monday, but | think there is now a chance we don’t get the info we need. In which
case we should discuss next steps.

Thanks

From: Vijay-A Sawant

Sent: Friday, November 30, 2018 12:51 AM
To: Stewart Oldfield <
Cc: Richard larossi <

=; Vinita Advani
>, Daphne Cales
Subject: RE: Gratitude

Importance: High

Good Morning Stew,
Any new updates from Gratitude?

Kind Regards,
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