No wire yet. We're monitoring and will let you know.

Vahe Stepanian

Key Client Partners

Deutsche Bank Secunties Inc.
Tel.
Mobile
Email

————— Original Message-----

From: Richard Kahn [iliG

Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2016 05:57 PM Eastern Standard Time
To: Vahe Stepanian

Ce: Stewart Oldfield, Jeanne Brennan; Gbenga Omosuyi

Subject: Re: Haze ||| GG

was wire in the amount of 6,102.924 received vesterday? today?
please advise
thank vou

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associales Inc

375 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022
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=0m Jul 21, 2016, at 11:49 AM. Vahe Stepanian < = Wwrole:
= Classification; Confidential
=10k - we'll keep an eve on the Harze acct next week.

= =-==-Original Message-----

= From: Richard Kahn ||1|:L't||ﬂ:_|
= Senl: Thursday, July 21 2016 11:49 AM

= To: Vahe Stepanian

= Cez Stewart Oldfield: Jeanne Brennan: Gbenga Omosuyi
= Subject; Re: Haze

= just found out payment will be middle of next week thanks

= Richard Kahn

= HBRK Associales Inc.

= 375 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
= New York. NY 10022
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