
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: 1/20/2017 10.111 
To: Vahe Stepanian 
CC: Darren Indyke Stewart Oldfield ; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Settlement... [CI 

sending US Dollars 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

On Jan 20, 2017, at 10:52 AM, Vahe Stepanian wrote: 

Classification: Confidential 

Hi Rich — please give me a call when you get a moment about the wire. Just want to confirm whether 
we're wiring Euros or USD. 

Thank you, 
Vahe 

From: Richard Kahn [m0111, 
Sent: Friday, January 20, 20 
To: Vahe Stepanian 
Cc: Stewart Oldfield; Darlene Zong; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Settlement... [C] 

did belle send you wire instructions? if so please confirm 75,000 wire will be going out today 
if not what is our deadline? 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 
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