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---Original Message---
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2016 05:57 PM Eastern Standard Time 
To: Vahe Stepanian 
Cc: Stewart Oldfield; Jeanne Brennan; Gbenga Omosuyi 
Subject: Re: Haze N4G024943 [C] 

I I 

<!--[if !supportLineBreakNewLine]—> 
<!--[endif]—> 

was wire in the amount of 6,102.924 received yesterday? today? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

> On Jul 21. 2016, at 11.49 AM. Vahe Stepanian 

> Classification: Confidential 

> Ok - we'll keep an eye on the Haze acct next week. 

> —Original Message—
> From: Richard Kahn 
> Sent: Thursday. July 21. 2016 11:49 AM 
> To: Vatic Stepanian 
> Cc: Stewart Oldfield: Jeanne Braman; Gbcnga Omosuyi 
> Subject: Re: Haze N4G024943 [C] 

>just found out payment will be middle of next week thanks 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 

Tote: 

>> On Jul 21, 2016, at 11:46 AM. Valle Stepanian e > wrote: 

>> Classification: Confidential 

>> Understood Rich. I'm out of office tomorrow. but my colleague Gbenga (CC'ed) will let you 
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