On Jun 21, 2017, at 11:29 AM, Cynthia Rodriguez _ wrote:

$7498.08 USD @ 1.143 = 6560 EUR. Please confirm in order to proceed. Thank you.

Kind regards,

Cynthia Rodriguez

Cynthia Rodriguez
Assistant Vice President

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
Deutsche Bank Wealth Management
345 Park Avenue, 24th Fl 10154-0004 New York, NY, USA

Sent: Wednesday, June 21, 2017 10:59 AM
To: Cynthia Rodriguez

Cc: Richard Kahn; Darren Indyke

Subject: Euros

Cynthia,
I need to purchase euros for $7.500 from mr. Epstein personal account. Please let me know if
Darren can receive it tomorrow and what 15 the exact amount of the check to AFEX.

Thank you,
Bella
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