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On Oct 31, 2017, at 10:27 AM, Stewart Oldfield ote: a 

It's a third party service that we don't control unfortunately. Sorry I don't have a better answer for you 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tuesday, October 31, 2017 10:06 AM 
To: Stewart Oldfiel 
Cc: Darren Indyke Bella Klein 
Subject: Fwd: Euros purchase 

we seem to run into this same issue with each purchase 
is there any sort of understanding we can come to regarding markup as i believe .03 is a bit to 
high.. 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK A i Inc.11. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Cynthia Rodriguez 
Subject: RE: Euros purch 
Date: October 31, 2017 at 10:01:41 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

arren ndyke 

Hi Rich, 

Afex has confirmed that this is the best they can do.

Kind regards, 

Cynthia Rodriguez 
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