
Subject: RE: JEE WT - confirmed 
From: Amanda Kirby ‹ > 
Date: Fri, 27 Mar 2015 12:48:21 -0400 
To: bellaklein 
Cc: Darren Indyke 

Richard Kahn 

Thanks Bella. I'll send the Reg E Disclosure once I have it 

From: bellaklein [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 12:46 PM 
To: Amanda Kirby 
Cc: Darren Indyke; Richard Kahn 
Subject: JEE WT - confirmed 

Amanda, 
Attached is the same wire to Russia with changed intermediary bank account. 
It is already confirmed with Darren. Please provide bank reference when 
available. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged information. 
If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this communication 
in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this 
communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the 
material in this communication is strictly forbidden. 
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Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information 
contained in this communication should not be regarded as such. 
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