
Subject: RE: Gratitude Wire - 15 000 Euro C] 
From: Bradley Gillin 
Date: Mon, 02 Apr 2018 13:23:05 -0400 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Bella Klein 

Classification: Confidential 

Richard, 
Please have Darren execute — I am having trouble locating paperwork showing 
you as a signer. Thank you. 

Regards, 
Brad 

{cid:image001.gif@OlD3CA85.694563F0} 

Bradley Gillin 
Vice President 
Deutsche Bank Wealth Management 
345 Park Avenue, 24th Fl 
New York NY 10154 
Tel. 
Fax 
Email

Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc. 

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, April 02, 2018 12:27 PM 
To: Bradley Gillin 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: Gratitude Wire - 15,000 Euro 

please call me to confirm and with any questions regarding form below 

EFTA01405760



attached are instructions i received 

thank you 

fcid:image002.png@OlD3CA85.694563F01 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside inf 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

EFTA01405761



From: hbrkscanner@gmail.com 

Date: April 2, 2018 at 12:24:57 PM EDT 

To: 

CS 3051ci 
[00:17:c8:25:f3:53] 

This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged information. 
If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this communication 
in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this 
communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the 
material in this communication is strictly forbidden. 

Please refer to https://db.com/disclosures for additional EU corporate and 
regulatory disclosures. 

Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information 
contained in this communication should not be regarded as such. 

EFTA01405762


