
Subject: Re: JEE (3) wires 
From: bellaklein 
Date: Tue, 10 Mar 2015 12:51:48 -0400 
To: Arthur Tendler < › 

Please process wire for 1000 Euros to 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

from JE acc 

> On Mar 10, 2015, at 12:48 PM, bellaklein < > wrote: 

> • Arthur, 
> Please confirm attached 3 wires. Please email bank reference after wires completed. 

> • <DB_JEE_Euro pdf><JEE_DB_Euro acc .pcii><JEE 
DB_Euro .pdf> 

> • Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

EFTA01412187


