
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Mar 25, 2019, at 12:37 PM, Brigid Macias e > wrote: 

> Its ok, I put up the request to ask them if they can amend of apply the 
payment as requested. 

I will keep you posted J 

Kind regards, 
Brigid Macias 
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