
Subject: Re: The Haze Trust a/c ending in 7287 
From: Richard Kahn < IMM> 
Date: Tue, 20 Jun 2017 09:03:43 -0400 
To: Cynthia Rodriguez 
Cc: Bella Klein 

Stewart Oldfield 
Jeanne Brennan 

thank you 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 8:58 AM, Cynthia Rodriguez ‹ > 
wrote: 

Hi Rich, 

Yes, the $7,725,000 came in at 542pm yesterday. 

Kind regards, 

Cynthia Rodriguez 
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Cynthia Rodriguez 
Assistant Vice President 

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas 
Deutsche Bank Wealth Management 
345 Park Avenue, 24th Fl 10154-0004 New York, NY, USA 

EFTA01414846



From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 8:55 AM 
To: Cynthia Rodriguez 
Cc: Bella Klein; Stewart Oldfield; Jeanne Brennan 
Subject: Re: The Haze Trust a/c ending in 7287 

was wire received yesterday? 
please advise 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 

New York, NY 10022 

On Jun 15, 2017, at 3:06 PM, Richard Kahn e > wrote: 

we are expecting a wire from christies on june 19th 
can you please confirm when received 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

EFTA01414847



This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged information. 
If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this communication 
in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this 
communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the 
material in this communication is strictly forbidden. 

Please refer to https://db.com/disclosures for additional EU corporate and 
regulatory disclosures. 

Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information 
contained in this communication should not be regarded as such. 
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