Subject: RE: JEE ATM card we use to withdraw cash [(C]

From: Daphne Cales < >

Date: Mon, 11 Jun 2018 12:22:32 -0400

To: Bradley Gillin <
Stewart Oldfield
Rodney Macelus <

Cc: Michele-M Quattrocchi

Classification: Confidential
Bradley,
We need the dates.

Kind regards,
Daphne Cales

Daphne Cales
Director | Banking Services & Branch Manager

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
WM Americas

345 Park Avenue,
Tel.
Fax
Mobile
Email

10154-6004 New York, NY, USA

----- Original Message-----

From: Bradley Gillin

Sent: Monday, June 11, 2018 12:13 PM
To: Stewart Oldfield

>; Rodney Macelus

: Michele-M Quattrocchi G

Subject: RE: JEE ATM card we use to withdraw cash [(C]

Cc: Daphne Cales

Classification: Confidential

Michele,

Please put up a ticket to let back office know the client will be in Paris.

EFTA01415645



_ - JEFFREY EPSTEIN

Regards,
Brad

Bradley Gillin

Vice President

Deutsche Bank Wealth Management
345 Park Avenue, 24th FL

New York, NY 10154

Fax

Email [

Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.

————— Original Message-----
From: Stewart Oldfield

Sent: Monday, June 11, 2018 12:09 PM

To: Bradley Gillin < >: Rodney Macelus
Cc: Daphne Cales

Subject: FW: JEE ATM card we use to withdraw cash
Should work, right?

————— Original Message-----

From: Richard Kahn [mailto:|| GG |
Sent: Monday, June 11, 2018 11:32 AM

To: Stewart Oldfield <|EG—_——————

Subject: JEE ATM card we use to withdraw cash

would it work in paris to take out euros from an ATM machine?
please advise
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell
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