
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Apr 5, 2019, at 11:06 AM, Brigid Macias wrote: 

Good Morning, 

Please find attached the letter to instruct us to process a check payable to 
Leslie. 

Please have both Trustees sign as authorization and return via email to 
everyone on this message. 

Kind regards, 
Brigid Macias 
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