
Subject: RE: wire to be received into JEGE 
From: Cynthia Rodriguez cr=l l 
Date: Mon, 24 Oct 2016 14:31:17 -0400 
To: Stewart Oldfield 

Darlene Zong <darlene.zon @db.com>, 
Vahe Stepanian 
Gbenga Omosuyi < ben a.omosuyi@db.com> 

Cc: Darren Indyke 

All, 

The final wire of $813,500 has hit the account. Please let us know if 
anything else is needed. Thank you. 

Kind regards, 

Cynthia Rodriguez 

{cid:image001.png@OlD0778D.2D49CDD0} 

Cynthia Rodriguez 
Assistant Vice President 

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas 
Deutsche Asset & Wealth Management 
345 Park Avenue, 10154-0004 New York, NY, USA 
Tel. (212)454-4577 
Fax (1101 
Email 

From: Stewart Oldfield 
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2016 11:06 AM 
To: Darlene Zong; Vahe Stepanian; Gbenga Omosuyi; Cynthia Rodriguez 
Cc: Darren Indyke 
Subject: wire to be received into JEGE 
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Team, 

Darren is expecting two wires into JEGE today in the amounts of $813,500 and 
$2,250 relating to the close of a transaction. Please advise when funds are 
rec'd so he can complete the closing. 

Thanks, 

Stew 

Stewart Oldfield, CFA, CAIA 
Director 

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas 
Deutsche Bank Wealth Management 
345 Park Avenue, New York, NY 10154 
Tel. ISIMIN 
Mobil blackberry 
Email 

Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc. 

This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged information. 
If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this communication 
in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this 
communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the 
material in this communication is strictly forbidden. 

Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information 
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contained in this communication should not be regarded as such. 
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