
Subject: RE: Haze N4 
From: Gbenga Omosuyi 
Date: Wed, 27 Jul 2016 12:02:43 -0400 
To: Stewart Oldfield
Cc: Brianna Fowler 

Vahe Stepanian < > 

Classification: For internal use only 

Havent received any wire yet. Will check again before EOD today, thanks. 

 Original Message 
From: Gbenga Omosuyi 
Sent: Tuesday, July 26, 2016 12:35 PM 
To: Stewart Oldfield 
Ce: Brianna Fowler. Vahe Stepanian 
Subject: RE: Haze (C) [I) 

Classification: For internal use only 

Hi Stewart - I actually just let Vahe know... nothing yet. Will keep you posted, thanks. 

 Original Message 
From: Stewart Oldfield 
Sent: Tuesday, July 26, 2016 12:30 PM 
To: Gbenga Omosuyi 
Cc: Brianna Fowle 
Subject: FW: HazeillaC) [II 

Classification: For internal use only 

Have you seen this come in yet? 

 Original Message 
From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2016 11:49 AM 
To: Vahe Stepanian 
Cc: Stewart Oldfield; Jeanne Brennan; Gbenga Omosuyi 
Subject: Re: Haze MIMI [C) 

just found out payment will be middle of next week thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

> On Jul 21, 2016, at 11:46 AM, Vahe Stepanian < > wrote: 

> Classification: Confidential 

> • Understood Rich. I'm out of office tomorrow, but my colleague Gbenga (CC'ed) will let you know. 

 Original Message 
> • From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
> Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2016 11:30 AM 
> To: Vahe Stepanian 
> Ce: Stewart Oldfield. Jeanne Brennan 
> Subject: Haze 

> we are expecting a wire tomorrow or monday - approximately 5,960,000 
> can you please confirm when received thanks 

> • Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New York, NY 10022 
> tel 212-971-1306 
> fax 646-350-0954 
> cell 917-414-7584 

EFTA01426702



> This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the inte 
nded recipient (or have received this communication in error) please notify the sender immediately a 
nd destroy this communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material 
in this communication is strictly forbidden. 

> • Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information contained in this communica 
tion should not be regarded as such. 
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