
Subject: Re: Hi Aracel - did we receive the -$10mm in Southern Trust acct. ending x44? [I] 
From: Paul Morris >
Date: Tue, 17 Dec 2 • • -
To: Aracely Sanchez 

Amanda Kirby < 

Classification: For internal use only 

Aracely when you see this can u put in the new flows tracker, amanda knows how 
to do, thx 

  Original Message  
From: Vahe Stepanian 
Sent: 12/17/2013 10:53 AM EST 
To: Aracely Sanchez 
Cc: Paul Morris 
Subject: Hi Aracely - did we receive the -$10mm in Southern Trust acct. 

ending x44? [I] 
Classification: For internal use only 

Thank you, 
Vahe 
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