Subject: Fw: wire additional information needed
From: Aracely Sanchez
Date: Mon, 23 Dec 2013 16:36:10 -0500

To: Paul Morris <} -

FYI. This is in reference to a wire sent on 12/13/2013. The Beneficiary bank
requested additional information before the funds could be placed in the
recipient’s account but they were not specific. Our back office has reached
out to the beneficiary bank three times and has escalated the case but no
response so far. I have been in contact with Rich and now Bella. Just reached
out to Banking Operations again and will keep you posted.

Kind regards,
Aracely Sanchez

(Embedded image moved to file: picli%96.gif)

Aracely Sanchez
Lssistant Vice President

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
Deutsche Asset & Wealth Management

Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.
(Embedded image moved to file: pic27236.gif)

—-———- Forwarded by Aracely Sanchez/db/dbcom on 12/23/2013 04:27 PM ————-

From: Aracely Sanchez/db/dbcom

To: !

Date: 12/23/2013 04:11 BM

Subiject: Fw: wire additional information needed

Bella—- Per our conversation, our back office reached out to the beneficiary
bank for the third time this morning but no response as of now. I will keep
you posted,
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Kind regards,
Aracely Sanchez

(Embedded image moved to file: piclB8039.gif)

Aracely Sanchesz
Lssistant Vice President

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
Deutsche Asset & Wealth Management

utsche Bank Securities Inc.
(Embedded image moved to file: pic30378.gif)

—-———— Forwarded by Aracely Sanchez/db/dbecom on 12/23/2013 04:05 PM ————-

From: Aracely Sanchez/db/dbcom
To: Richard Kahn </ - ¢ CEUBAINT,
Date: 12/20/2013 02:33 BM
Subiject: FEe: wire additicnal information needed
Not yet.

Kind regards,
Aracely Sanche=z

(Embedded image moved to file: picZl3l0.gif)

Aracely Sanchez
Bssistant Vice President

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
Deutsche Asset & Wealth Management
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Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.

(Embedded image moved to file: pic0l1708.gif)

From: Richard Kahn < -
To: Aracely Sanchez/db/dbcom@DBAMERICAS,
Date: 12/20/2013 02:32 PM

Subiject: Ee: wire additional information needed

any update

Eichard Eahn
HERE I -iates In

On Dec 20, 2013, at 10:13 AM, Aracely Sanchez «:._ wrote:

Mo response yet, Our wire room sent the second chaser asking for

=1

response again this morning. I will provide an update as scon as I hear

fraom them.

Kind regards,
Aracely Sanche=z

<Mail Attachment.gif>

Aracely Sanchez
Assistant Vice President

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
Deutsche Asset & Wealth Management
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Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.
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From: rRichard Eahn <|
Tao: Aracely Sanchez/db/dbcomBDBAMERICAS,
Date: 12/20/2013 05:38 AM

Subiject: Fe: wire additional information needed

any update?
thank you

Richard Eahn
HERE Associates Inc.

On Dec 1%, 2013, at 4:04 BM, Aracely Sanchez _

wrote:
NMothing yet.. I've asked our back office to reach out again.

Kind regards,
Aracely Sanchez

<Mail Attachment.gif=

Aracely Sanchez
Assistant Vice President

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas

Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.

<Mail Attachment.gif>
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From: Richard Kahn < -

To: Aracely Sanchez/db/dbcom@DBAMERICAS,
Date: 12/15%/2013 03:45 FM
Subiject: FEe: wire additional information needed

any update on this?
please advise
thanks

Richard Eahn

On Dec 19, 2013, at 9:01 aM, Aracely sanchez <TG

wrote:

Good morning Rich- I forwarded the information provided. Our back coffice
has reached out to the beneficiary bank. We are waiting for a response
as to what information is missing. Hopefully the address is encough and
will keep you posted.

Kind regards,
Aracely Sanchez

<Mail Attachment.gif>

Aracely Sanchez
Assistant Vice President

Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
Aalal=] z ent

Securities ocffered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.
<Mail Attachment.gif>
From: Richard Kahn <[ -

To: Aracely Sanchez/db/dbcom@DBAMERICAS,
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Date: 12/18/2013 01:02 BM

Subject: FEe: wire additicnal information needed

recipient of wire just confirmed that wire instructions we sent you were
correct

only new information i1 have is bank address: Lopuszanska 3Bd 02-232
Warszawa

can you please confirm what information is missing?
thank you

REichard Eahn
HEBERE Associates Inc.

On Dec 18, 2013, at 11:22 AM, Aracely Sanchez _>

wrote:

Classification: External Communication

Rich-Just following up on the below. Were you able to obtain additional
information?

<graycol.gifrAracely Sanchez

————— Original Message -———-

From: Aracely Sanchesz

Sent: 12/17/2013 10:39 AM EST

To:

Subject: wire additional information needed
Rich- As a follow up to our conversation this is the message we

received.

WE HAVE BEEN ADWVISED THAT THIS TRANSACTION CANMOT BE APPLIED WITH THE
INFOEMATION GIVEN

PLEASE PROVIDE ADDITIONAL DETAILS TC ENAELE THE BENEFICIARY BAMNES TO
APPLY FUNDS..

Kind regards,
Aracely Sanchez

<13126977.gif>

Aracely Sanchez
Assistant Vice President

EFTA01466032



Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas
Deutsche Asset & Wealth Management

Securities offered through Deutsche Bank Securities Inc.
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This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.

If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this
communication

in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this
communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of
the

material in this communication is strictly forbidden.

Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information
contained in this communication should not be regarded as such.

This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.

If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this
communication

in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this
communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of
the

material in this communication is strictly forbidden.

Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information
contained in this communication should not be regarded as such.

This communication may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.

If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this
communication

in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this
communication. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of
the

material in this communication is strictly forbidden.

Deutsche Bank does not render legal or tax advice, and the information
contained in this communication should not be regarded as such.
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