
From: Richard Kahn 
To: PB-Service1318 
Cc: Harry Beller 

Subject: re: wire (1) 4-19-2012 

Please call Harry to confirm 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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ID: 

JEGE INC. 

Memorandum. 

DATE: 04/19/2012 16:09:00 Page 1 of 2 DID CSID: INDEXt INDEX2: 

To: Janet, W Morgan 

From: Harry Beller. 

Date; April 19, 2012 

Re: •JEGE 
Account la 
4* ***** 4 ** 

Please wire Forty Nine Thousand Nine Hundred Severity Dollars and 00/100 
($49,970.00) from the above account to: 
Bank name: Bank of America N.A. 

ABA #: 026009593 

Account name: World Fuel Services 

Account # 

Reference: Inv 2915709-21101 & Inv 382458-23101 
Customer # 116809 
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