
From: '• (NY) (FBI)"

To: 'aO)In (DO) (FBI)" 
(DO) (FBI)" 

Subject: RE: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Date: Mon, 16 Dec 2019 17:56:38 +0000 

I mportance: Normal 

Hi - I apologize for bothering you again but the therapist just left me another message asking if she should 
call someone at hq. Please let me know how to proceed. 

Thanks again for your help! 

Oh - I should I also send the over invoice for the victim in Florida to you? 

On Dec 13, 2019 4:07 PM, '° (NY) (FBI)" < > wrote: 
Hi - the therapist just asked me when she would hear from you. Please let me know how I should respond. 

Thanks for your help ! 

On Dec 12, 2019 1:01 PM," . (DO) (FBI)"
I will contact her with my card information, thanksll 

Sentizes DivisLovt. 
Federal Bureau of tywestigati.ov‘ 

> wrote: 

From: (NY) (FBI) 
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 12:59 PM 
To: . (DO) (FBI) •‘: 2.; (DO) (FBI) < >; 
(DO) (FBI) < > 
Subject: RE: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Hi I just sent them to you. The therapist is now saying she accept credit card. What should I tell her when 
she will receive payment? 

Thanks 

On Dec 12, 2019 9:23 AM, " (DO) (FBI)" < > wrote: 
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Min 

Can you please forward the two invoices for to IM? 

Thanks, 

Program Manager 
FBI Victim Services Division 
Office: 
Mobile: 
Email: 

On Dec 12, 2019 9:04 AM, " (DO) (FBI)" cta wrote: 

The invoices are exactly the same, for the same date, etc. I need invoices with 2 separate dates. 

Victim Services Division 
Federal Bureau of Investigation 

----Ori inal Messa e---
From: (DO) (FBI) 
Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2019 4:05 PM 
To:  . (DO) (FBI) 
Cc: (DO) (FBI) (DO) 
(HRD) (FBI) . (DO) (FBI) 

; (FBI)  ; 
(DO) (FBI) 

. (DO) (FBI)
Subject: FW: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Hi 

Please pay the attached invoices. If you have any questions, please let me know. Thanks! 

Unit Chief 
FBII Victim Services Division 
Program Support Unit 
Phone: 

----Ori inal Message---
From: (HRD) (FBI) 
Sent: Wednesda , December 11, 2019 2:36 PM 
To: (DO) (FBI) 
Cc: . (DO) (FBI) 

. (DO) (FBI) 
Subject: FW: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Hi 

(DO) (FBI) < MME>; 

It looks like was not able to make the EVAF payment for the attached invoices before she deployed. I am unable to 
make the payment since my GPC card was compromised. The request was entered on the SharePoint site, ID 703. 

EFTA01650544



Please advise on how you would like to handle this payment. 

Thank you, 

----Ori inal Messa e----
From: . (DO) (FBI) 
Sent: Monde , December 02, 2019 3:46 PM 
To: (HRD) (FBI) 
Cc: . (DO) (FBI)
Subject: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Iii 

Can you please pay the attached invoices? These are for a victim of Epstein. I'll add these to the SharePoint site later 
tonight. 

Program Manager 
Victim Services Division 
FBIHQ, Room 3329 
Telephone: 
Cell:= 
Fax: 
E-mail: 
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