
From: 

To: 

Subject: Re: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Date: Thu, 12 Dec 2019 19:43:38 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

(NY) (FBI)" 

H 

Are we good? Or do you need anything else from either or myself? 

Thanks, 

From: (DO) (FBI) la 
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 1:01:26 PM 
To: 
(DO 
Subject: RE: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

: < 

I will contact her with my card information, thanks!

. , 

I sWe.StieRtiOn 

From: (NY) (FBI) 
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 12:59 PM 
To 
(DO) (FBI) < > 
Subject: RE: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Hi I just sent them to you. The therapist is now saying she accept credit card. What should I tell her when 
she will receive payment? 

Thanks 

On Dec 12, 2019 9:23 AM, "=, 

Can you please forward the two invoices fo 

Thanks, 

L. (DO) (FBI)" < 

to IM? 

> wrote: 

Program Manager 

EFTA01650546



FBI Victim Services Division 
Office: 
Mobile: 
Email: 

On Dec 12, 2019 9:04 AM, M, (DO) (FBI)" ̀ ' IME' wrote: 

The invoices are exactly the same, for the same date, etc. I need invoices with 2 separate dates. 

Victim ervices Division 
Federal Bureau of Investigation 

-----Ori inal Messa e----
From: (DO) (FBI) 
Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2019 4:05 PM 
To: 
Cc: 
(H 

Subject: FW: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Hi IN, 

Please pay the attached invoices. If you have any questions, please let me know. Thanks! 

Unit Chief 
FBI I Victim Services Division 
Program Support Unit 
Phone: 

----Original Message---
From: (HRD) (FBI) 
Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2019 2:36 PM 

(DO) (FBI) la 

Subject: FW: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Hi 

It looks like as not able to make the EVAF payment for the attached invoices before she deployed. I am unable to 
make the paymen since my GPC card was compromised. The request was entered on the SharePoint site, ID 703. 

Please advise on how you would like to handle this payment. 

Thank you, 

tv•g la e-s- - 
From: =, (DO) (FBI) 
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Sent: Monday, December 02, 2019 3:46 PM 
To: (FBI) 
Cc:aO) (FBI) 
Subject: EVAF - Payment for Invoices 

Hi 

Can you please pay the attached invoices? These are for a victim of Epstein. I'll add these to the SharePoint site later 
tonight. 

Program Manager 
Victim Services Division 
FBIHQ, Room 3329 
Telephone: 
Cell: 
Fax: 
E-mail: 

THIS DOCUMENT IS INTERNAL AND MAY NOT BE RELEASED OUTSIDE TIME FBI WITHOUT PRIOR 
AUTHORIZATION CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE — This e-mail (including attachments) is covered by the Electronic 
Communication Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. sections 2510-2512, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) to which it is 
addressed and may contain confidential and sensitive material that requires protection from unauthorized 
disclosures. Recipients shall not disclose any Personally Identifiable Information (PII) contained in this email (including 
attachments) without the prior written or electronic consent of the FBI and shall take such actions as are necessary to 
prevent unauthorized access to such information by a person other than the intended recipient(s). Do not disseminate this 
email, or its contents, to anyone who does not have an official need for access. If you are not an intended recipient and 
received this communication in error, you are hereby notified that any retention, review, dissemination, distribution, or 
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. Please notify the sender by a separate e-mail and delete this message 
and any attachments. Any misuse of unauthorized disclosure can result in both civil and criminal penalties. 
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