
From: '  (DN) (FBI)" <1 

To: (00) (FBI)" <1 

Cc: (NY) (FBI)" <1 

Subject: Fevaf-Epstein case 

Date: Wed, 04 Dec 2019 22:25:41 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Attachments: 20191202154825179.pdf 
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See attached letter an invoice. 

I'm requesting emergency funds to reimburse SASO for expenses they paid out of pocket to assist 

When VS informed me of this victim in my AOR, I immediately referred her to SASO for assistance as I am 6 hours 
away from her location. most urgent need was a birth certificate so that she could get a valid ID to be able to obtain 
work. This also was important for her travel to Miami for the briefing. Also, because of the short notice of travel to 
Miami and the distance from me, Ms. Demko assisted so that she could actually get on the plane to Miami. We also 
received a call with, very short notice, that did not have transportation home from the airport. The airport is 
a ways out of town and public transportation is minimal. Also,. has absolutely zero income and had no money to 
travel. Thus SASO fronted the money for these needs. I'm requesting reimbursement to SASO in the amount of $189. See 
attached letter and invoice for complete details. 

Victim Specialist 
FBI Denver-Colorado Springs RA 
O: 
C: 

From: Maura Doherty-Demko [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 03, 2019 10:13 AM 
To: . (DN) (FBI) < > 
Subject: FW: Hey lady... 

With warm regard, 

Maura Doherty Demko 
Executive Director 

Niv SASO 
Sexual Services 

www.durangosaso.org
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24 hour hotline 970-247-5400 
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