
Sent: Thursday, April 28, 2011 7:49:27 PM 
Subject: Re: Loan 
From: Barry Josephson 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation©gmail.com> 

I wanted you to understand how the Dan Crown deal works as you asked. They make an 
overhead investment in my company over 2 years which started July '10 and runs through July '12. 
They recoup in two ways, overhead reimbursement directly from the studios that make any of my 
films, and by having a 5% share of my producer fees and back end of projects developed during 
the two year term. If the 600k hasn't been fully recouped within the term, they charge 10% per 
annum but can only recoup via this system. I have no current or further obligation to repay from 
myself personally or from any other source. 
Please let me know if you want a copy of that signed agreement for your perusal and files. 

On Wed, Apr 27, 2011 at 10:17 AM, Barry Josephson wrote: 

I have an outstanding line at Private Bank (my bank, no pressure) for 300k, which they will 
continue to carry. I am slowly paying off my contractor 226k, and I have a two tax obligations 
105 to California due May 6th, and 480k Federal due in December. California I will pay off on 
that date, and federal will be paid from a film fee. I have no outstanding liens and my credit 
rating across the board is above 720. 

On Wed, Apr 27, 2011 at 4:32 AM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

what do you already owe, ? and to whom 

n ::-On Tue, Apr 26, 2011 at 10:16 PM, Barry Josephso wrote: 

Jeffery, 
Thank you very much for hearing me out today. 

Attached please find the document we discussed. Please let me know if you need any other 
information. 

I cannot tell you how much this consideration means to me. 

Best, 
Barry J 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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