
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2015 3:26 PM 
To: Lvjet 
Subject: Re: BBJ 

we know of the asian buyer , and he is not a realQ=A0 buyer. ask her to transmit the 25 offer. with a quick close.40=A0 
she can tell the owner that we will put 5 million in escrow immed=taely,  he wants a quick close. 

<=iv class="gmail_extra"> 

On Wed, Oct 21, 20=5 at 11:18 AM, Lvjet target=> wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Victoria just called me, she thanked you for the offer and quick close= she informs $25M will not get a counter 

offer, she also informed th=t during the Demo flight in Asia, the aircraft was hit by lightning, =ence, Jet Aviation Basil 
visit to replace wingtip or winglet, the dam=ge was assessed and the operator was given 10 hours to fly the aircraft 
to=Mx facility to have lightning strike investigated and repaired, she will s=nd photo's of the damage shortly. 

--.she also said the Asian buyer made offer in very LOWQ=A030's which was declined, Victoria said $32M would 
be accepted, =only a guess, that was owners counter to Asian buyer), she also=said the Asian buyer has not produced 
another offer, according to her the =sian buyer has interest still and expecting another offer from this buyer.=/div> 

=lease note 

The information contained in this communication is 
c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside in=ormation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
co=munication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawf=l. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> , and 
destroy th=s communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copy=ight -all rights reserved 
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