
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, September 27, 2015 2:36 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: B727 invoice 

yes, of course. 

On Sun, Sep 27, 2015 at 10:35 A=, Larry Visoski wrote: 

Jeffrey 
May I have your approval to pay one more invoice from 8727 A2 inspection fo= $9,333.99 
Change start valve in #3 engine 

Thank you 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=div class="gmail_signature"> 
=AO please note 

The information contained in this commu=ication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may cons=itute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addre=see. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copyi=g of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited a=d may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all a=tachments. copyright -all 
rights reserved 
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