
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 16, 2014 8:38 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Final Balance for Club chairs 

yes 

On Tue, Dec 16, 2014 at 4:26 PM, Richard Kahn < 
wrote: 

please advise if ok to pay final balance (50%)=of 9,515.67 for 4 chairs to be delivered Friday 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">=b>From: 
Gregory=Riches <griches=nyc.rr.com <mailto:griches@nyc.rr.com» 

Subject: Final Balance for Club chairs 
</=pan> 
Date: December 16, 2014 at 1:33:01 PM EST 

To: Richard Kahn 

Ric=, 
Below is the final invoice for the club chairs for 9 East 71st. 
This need to be paid by friday when the chairs are scheduled to be de=ivered. 
Any questions please let me know. 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: <=pan style="font-family:Helvetica;font-size:inherit">JENNYJARRIN 
<jenny@jmupholst=ryinc.com> 

Subject: Re: Deposit Check 

Date: <=pan style="font-family:Helvetica;font-size:inherit">December 16, 2014 1:=4:08 PM EST 

To: Gregory Riches < 

Hi Gregory, 

Please find the attached invoice for the=4 chairs as you requested. 

Best, 

</=iv> 
Jenny 

, 2014 at 12:20 PM, Gregory Riches 

Hi Jenny, 
I need the final invoice for these chairs a=d please include tax. 
It need to be submitted as soon as possibl= to my clients CFO for payment . 

The chairs =re being picked up friday by Eric's trucking in the early afternoon4=iv> 

Thanks, 
Gregory 

=div> 
On Oct 16, 2014, at 3:36 PM, JENNY JARRIN <j 

<=iv> 
Hi Gregory, 

Please find the copy of=the deposit check for the 4 Cube chairs. 

Best, 

Jenny 

JM UPHOLSTERY INC 

wrote: 

http://www.jmupholsteryinc.com <http://www.jmupholsteryinc.c=mh 
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Jenny Jarr=n 

<CHECK_-10162014153306.pdf> 

Gregory Riches 
INTERIORS 

a el:%28212%29%20679=20-%205211> <=div> 

JM UPHOLSTERY INC 

18%29%20786-0104> 
http://www.jmupholsteryinc.com <http://www.jmupholsteryinc.co=/> 

Jenny Jarri= 

aiv style="word-wrap:break-word"> 

Gregory Riches 
INTERIORS 

M tel:%28212%29%20679=20-%205211> adiv> 

clear="all"> 

The informa=ion contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cl=ent privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only=for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthori=ed use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof=is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received thiscommunication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail =r by e-mail to =eevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies=thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
adiv> 
--001a11333108c2a0eb050a5b5464-- date-last-viewed 0.0 date-received 1418762263 flags 8590195713 
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