
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, July 29, 2015 5:45 PM 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: Hotel for -Pay for incidentals? 

yes 

On Wed, Jul 29, 2015 at 1:44 PM, Lesley Groff &l=  > wrote: 

We have prepa=d for hotel room, but do you want to pay for her incidental= as well? 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this commu=ication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may cons=itute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addre=see. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copyi=g of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited a=d may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all a=tachments. copyright -all 
rights reserved 

--001a11c1b654c3e83e051c0725a3-- date-last-viewed 0.0 date-received 1438191907 flags 8590195713 remote-id 
161737 

EFTA_R1_00006454 
EFTA01732867


