
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, October 20, 2015 10:32 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: Nautica boat 

yes 

On Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 6:26 PM, Larry Visoski < > =gt; wrote: 

$140k completed 
You mentioned Payi=g Ed $25k to manage project, is that included in the completed $140 price =r addition to? 

$90k to Ed fo= boat payment. 

$50k for improvements, 
=div> 

Total for boat completed $140k 

Sent from =y iPhone 

On Oct 20, 2015, at 5:52 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com</=» wrote: 

=nly completed lights engines 140 

On Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 5=48 PM, Larry Visoski target=» 
wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Ed Hinckley informs he bought the boat without engines, he purchased Factor= demo engines 

from Suzuki. 

Pls confirm the Deal for Ed would be: 
-Purchase boat for $90k(?) 

-Ed will provide estimates for: 

-New Paint 
-rear deck repair which will include seating TBD. 
-new Tubes 
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-new Stereo system 
-seating 
-replace some widows that are fog stained. 

Message from Ed: 

We have a few $ over 90k in it, motors steering alone 5Ok in July 2014 if h= wants for 90k it's a 
deal. If he wants me to manage the p=oject I would be willing to discuss. Or Zed Bennett the fella there at the=shop has 
designed and built many boats. He's just very busy. 

Pls advise your deal 
Thx 

Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, m=y be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and=is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or=any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you hav= received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by<=r>return e-mail or by e-mail to 

jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtojeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicati=n and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rig=ts reserved 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may c=nstitute inside 
information, and is intended only for the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, disclosure or 
co=ying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error =please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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