
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2015 5:07 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Boat project 

no no no , we will pay a 140 all in when=finished. we will lien against boat 50 to finish, and then balance o= 
completion 

On Wed, Oct 21, 2015 at 1:05 PM, Richard Kahn < 
wrote: 

>>> 

please confirm pricing of 140,000 and 25,000 to E= is correct 
i assume that 90k down and 50k paid by us directly to vend=rs and 25k to Ed when boat is completed to your 

satisfaction 

should we have an independent survey done before proceeding 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel /a> 
fax <tel > 
cell <tel 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:Opx:margin-right:Opx:margin-bottom:Opx:margin-left:=px">From: Lvjet <=a 
href="mailto:Ivjet@aol.com" target="_blank">lvjet@aol.com> 

project 
Subject: <=pan style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica Neue,Helvetica,sans=serif">Boat 

Date: October 21, 2015 at 12:50:46 PM EDT 
<=span> 
To: richardkahnl2=gmail.com < 

Rich, 
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regarding 41ft Nautica Boat project,. Jeffrey has agreed to pay $140,0=0 for Boat completed by Ed 
Hinckley. 

Its my understanding that we'll pay Ed Hinckley $90,000 for boat a=d engines with fresh title. 
Refurbish project will have a Budget of $50,000.00 to include by not I=mited to: 

-New Paint, same colors. 
-New Tubes, color TBD 
-all systems in working order, lights etc, bow spot light installed. <=div> 
-New seating for passenger compartment and rear deck TBD by JEE. 
-reinstall Generator, ops check Cabin AC unit 
-Install stereo system 
-change some cabin windows that are fogged 
-remove damage rotten wood on rear deck, and install new Fiberglass lerel floor. 
-new synthetic Teak looking Cork product on deck. 

Jeffrey offered $25,000 in addition to Ed Hinckley to manage this proj=ct, I made it clear to Ed, he is to 
share all estimates and invoices with =s during this project. 

total cost of boat without shipping to STT, $165,000.00 

thank you 
Larry 

=C24) please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
chiv> 
--001a1130cbf28ac37a0522a0683f-- date-last-viewed 0.0 date-received 1445447227 flags 8590195713 gmail-

label-ids 23 remote-id 555257 

2 

EFTA_R1_00007017 
EFTA01733275


