Subject: Re: Democrati '

From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Friday, Movember 4, 29
Ce: Jeanne Brennan

To: Cecile deJongh

yes Ste

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Nov 4, 2016, at 2:24 PM, Cecile de Jongh _

wrolte:

Stacey Plaskett just called me and said that Erika told her to contact me re her
conversation with JE and his support for the Dem Party. I'm assuming
that this is to come from STC, right?

With warm regards,

Cecile

On Friday, November 4, 2016 1:58 PM, Cecile de Jongh _? wrote:

| have not heard from Erika about this.

With warm regards,

Cecile

On Friday, November 4, 2016 1,45 PM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:
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has erika reached out?
have we made payments?
please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Erika Kellerhals <G

Subject: Re: Democratic clubs in STT & STX
Date: November 4, 2016 at 11:52:41 AM EDT
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com=>

Ce: Richara ke [

Thanks. I'll check in with Cecile.

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 4, 2016, at 10:56 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

I already forwarded it to office with a yes , of
course

On Fri, Nov 4, 201 - | rhals
< wrote:

Any thoughts on this? Stacey is hounding me.

Erika A. Kellerhals

Member

Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC
Royal Palms Professional Building
9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101
St. Thomas, VI 00802
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MNotice: This communication may contain privileged or other
confidential

information. If you are not the intended recipient, or believe that you

have received this communication in error, please do not print, copy,

re-transmit, disseminate, or otherwise use this information. Also,
please

indicate to the sender that you have received this e-mail in error, and

delete the copy you received. Thank you.

Circular 230: To ensure compliance with the requirements imposed
by the

IRS, we inform you that any tax advice contained in our
communication

(including any attachments) was not intended or written to be used,
and

cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding any tax penalty or (ii)

promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any
transaction or

matter addressed herein.

On 10/31/16, 5:59 PM, "Erika Kellerhals" -

wrote:

>$5000 each club from STC. I'll send details for delivery tomorrow.
>Thanks.
>

=Sent from my iPhone

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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