
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2016 8:16:50 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Pokey: Staff Bath 
To: Jeffrey leevacationegmall.com> 

Hey Bossman, 

Would you like us to give Pokey his final payment for the staff bath? $1,500.00 

Bid was for: $12,000.00 
Paid to date: $10,500.00 
Owed: $1,500.00 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez 
Date: October 25, 2016 at 4:19:00 PM AST 
To: Jeffrey leevacation@rnail.com>
Subject: Pokey: Staff Bath 

Hey Bossman, 

Pokey has completed the Staff Bath. 
Danny has confirmed that Pokey is 100% completed and it's now for him to do the 

plumbing. 

Bid was for: $12,000.00 
Paid to date: $10,500.00 
Owed: $1,500.00 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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