
From: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2016 3:38:30 PM 
Subject: Re: Chillax 
To: "jeffrey E" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 25, 2016, at 11:31 AM, jeffrcy E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

yees 

On Tue, Oct 25, 2016 at 11:26 AM, Brice Gordon •c==. wrote: 

Confirming the chillax room will be the priority work for Sylvester, doors 
secondary ? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 25, 2016, at 6:35 AM, Ann Rodriquez wrote: 

ok 

Ann R. 

On Oct 25, 2016, at 6:29 AM, Brice Gordon wrote: 

Ok 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 25, 2016, at 6:17 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

woudl be rive if while im away we can do 
chillax room windows if not temp doors or 
large windows made by Sylvester that match 
the back terrace. . thanks 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@nmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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