
From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Loan 
Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2016 3:11:46 PM 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeeyacation@gmail.com> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Cecile de Jongh czEM 
Subject: Re: Loan 
Date: October 25, 2016 at 11:11:04 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Reply-To: Cecile de Jongh 

Good morning Rich, 

I will repay (lump sum) the balance of the loan plus accrued interest on or before 
June 30, 2017. I do not wish to have my paycheck reduced every two 
weeks. Thank you. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

On Monday, October 17, 2016 4:32 PM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

thank you for update 
please send check to NY in next package 
regarding final repayment of 50,000 i would say either of 2 options could work: 

a) lump payment by june 30, 2017 or 
b) 3000 per paycheck every 2 weeks over 17 paychecks or 34 weeks 

lets discuss 
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thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

On Oct 14. 2016, at 2:40 PM, Cecile de Jongh 
wrote: 

Good afternoon Rich, 

We finally closed on our loan (it took almost six weeks just to get an 
appraiser assigned). Unfortunately, we could only get 
$150,000 cash-out because of the cap on the loan amount for 
a two-family home. I spoke to JE re how I pay the $150,000 
back to STC and he said to speak with you. Do you want me 
to write a check and mail it to you? Or, should I have Jeanne 
deposit it locally? JE said of the balance that we will figure 
something out. I will be able to pay the $50,000 plus the 
interest within the first six months of 2017. Let me know your 
thoughts, thanks. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 
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