
Sent: Friday, October 28, 2016 6:34:36 PM 
From: 
Subject: Re: lease e 
To: "jeffrey E" <jeevacation©gmail.com> 

lk -Fon 
And there is November rent is coming 1203$ . 
Can I ask her to transfer for me please ? 

From: 'cff E. < ccvacation(it? ail.corn>; 
To: 
Subject: Re: Please help 
Sent: Fri, Oct 28, 2016 6:28:46 PM 

ok get from beta 

On Fri, Oct 28, 2016 at 2:52 PM, wrote: 

Good morning Jeffrey , 
Have a question . 
I still don't receive my documents and Arda told me now it takes forever so it could take couple 
of month more ,and yesterday Bebe called me from the office that Darren has for me a new lease 
agreement for the apt to sign . It's mean I have to deal with my wife but I spoke to her recently 
and she complained again that there is no money . I'm afraid she's not going to sign anything 
until I have something for her on our joint bank account . Please could help . 

Thank you,* 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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