
From: Alireza Ittihadieh < 
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacationagmail.com> 
Subject: Re: 2003 550 
Sent Tuesday, May 3. 2016 7:06:28 PM 

44 is due in July. We can incorporate that into the prebuy. 

Yes, has HUD/EVS. 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
From: jeffrey E. 
Sent: Tuesday, 3 May 2016 14:38 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: 2003 550 

probably i have no issues with depositi monies. details. ? if it is 2003 the 144 months needs 
full completion. at that price. . does it have hud, evs. etc 

On Tue, May 3, 2016 at 2:36 PM, Alireza Ittihadieh rote: 

would you put up non-refundable $1.5M? subject to Pre-Purchase? 

From: Jeffrey E. [nailto:leevaCation@amail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 3, 2016 7:35 PM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: 2003 550 

18 

On Tue, May 3, 2016 at 2:09 PM, Alireza Ittihadieh 

What price 

Alireza I. 

On 3 May 2016, at 14:09, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(agmail.com> wrote: 

> wrote: 
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Yes 

On Tuesday, 3 May 2016, Alireza Ittihadich <alirezaCafreestreambermticia bill> wrote: 

Any Interest? 

RRCC 

2400 hours 

1100 landings 

Make offer 

Best regards, 
<irnage001.gif> 
Alireza Ittihadieh, President Rti Chief Exen nave 

Freestream Aircraft (Bermuda) Limited Cilium's Coon 22 Vierotio Street PO nos 11M 1 179 Ilamilron IIM EX 

Ikrusida 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to kevacation@gmail com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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