
From: Alireza Ittihadieh 
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacationegmail.com> 
Subject: RE: 2003 550 
Sent Tuesday. May 3, 2016 6:36:49 PM 

would you put up non-refundable $1.5M? subject to Pre-Purchase? 

From: Jeffrey E. (mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Tuesday, May 3, 2016 7:35 PM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: 2003 550 
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On Tue, May 3, 2016 at 2:09 PM, Alireza Ittihadieh 
What price 

Alireza I. 
On 3 May 2016, at 14:09, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes 

On Tuesday, 3 May 2016, Alireza Ittihadieh wrote: 
Any Interest? 

RRCC 
2400 hours 
1100 landings 
Make offer 

Best regards, 
<finage001.gif> 
Alireza Ittihadieh, Pi( 

Freestream Aircraft (Bermuda) Limited 
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no's Cot wt 12 Vt.-ton:1 Street PO Box If NI I I79 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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